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An exciting lightweight clash is set to unfold as rising star Floyd “Kid Austin” Schofield takes on 
former world champion Tevin Farmer in a bout that blends youth, speed, and high-level boxing 
skill. This is more than just another fight — it’s a pivotal crossroads encounter. Schofield aims to 
continue his ascent through the 135-pound ranks, while Farmer looks to reestablish himself 
among the division’s elite after a lengthy layoff. 

 

Floyd Schofield (17-0, 12 KOs) has quickly become one of the most talked-about prospects in 
boxing. Known for his flashy style, sharp combinations, and confident ring presence, Schofield 
has impressed fans and critics alike with his maturity and poise. Trained by his father and 
backed by Golden Boy Promotions, “Kid Austin” now takes a big leap in competition. This fight 
will show whether he’s ready for the top tier of the lightweight division or still in development 
mode. 

On the other side stands Tevin Farmer (30-5-1, 6 KOs), a slick defensive wizard and former IBF 
super featherweight champion. Known for his exceptional head movement, ring generalship, 
and grit, Farmer returns to the spotlight after dealing with injuries and promotional setbacks. 
Once considered one of the most avoided fighters in his weight class, Farmer brings a wealth of 
experience and high boxing IQ to the table. While he may not pack devastating power, his ability 
to outbox and outthink opponents has earned him respect throughout the sport. 

The matchup pits raw talent against polished experience. Schofield will likely look to push the 
pace, test Farmer’s timing, and impose his youth and energy. Farmer, meanwhile, will try to 
frustrate the younger fighter, force mistakes, and turn the bout into a technical showcase. If 
Schofield can break through the veteran’s defenses, it would mark a significant step forward in 
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his career. But if Farmer can turn back the clock, it would be a massive statement that he’s still a 
force to be reckoned with. 

Expect a battle of wits, reflexes, and strategy — one that could shape the lightweight division’s 
future. 
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